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concierge@activeworldclub.net

From: Married With Crypto <marriedwithcrypto@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 28, 2022 9:24 AM
To: Alex garza
Cc: Active World Club
Subject: Re: Member Token Purchase

Thank you Alex. 
 
Once the club has your tokens from your wallet, let me know please.  Thanks.   
 
I did speak to Alfonso earlier and he can get the wire out asap, but your tokens need to be pulled first so, let me know 
once that is done.  I need to have concierge email me tho that it has been done. 
 
Thanks!! 
 
On Thu, Jul 28, 2022 at 10:07 AM Alex garza <agarza17@hotmail.com> wrote: 
I have sent my bank information through my email directly to the concierge. I approve the holding of my tokens by 
AWB. As per Scott I am in time to have the wire transfer sent today rather than Monday.  
 
Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone 
Get Outlook for Android 

From: Married With Crypto <marriedwithcrypto@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, July 28, 2022 9:09:59 AM 
To: Active World Club <concierge@activeworldclub.net>; agarza17@hotmail.com <agarza17@hotmail.com> 
Subject: Member Token Purchase  
  
Hey guys/gals.  
 
I am going to help Mr. Garza out with his club token purchase to help him save his house.  I'm sure ya'll have seen him 
post on discord.   
 
I have spoke to Alfonso, so he told me to email you and we'll facilitate everything through the club.   
 
I have agreed to buy his AWB, SPEED, and Carbon for $25k.  Along with his 2 deck hands that he'll send me directly.   
 
So, on the 1st, instead of wiring me my scheduled wire, just wire Mr. Garza his $25k and take it out what is owed to me. 
 
Once his tokens are in the clubs control and wire has been sent, you may send the tokens to my wallet. 
 
0x57351fa7521441e6b9be5eeb46b125db2c3c3718 
 
Mr. Garza.  Please respond to his email with both me and the club copied on it to provide your wire instructions and 
your agreement to your token purchase please.   
 
Thanks.  
Scott 


